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This is a basic set up guide for single or 
 

multiple room  wireless system illustrating 

various fittings and wireless control options.

WIRELESS 
SETUP GUIDE

WIRELESS 
CONTROLS

Step 1. Install the luminaires 
and connect to a permanent 
mains supply. The luminaires 
must have been fitted with 
either a wireless driver or a 
wireless module.

Step 2. Commission the fittings 
and control devises using a 
phone App.

Mymesh.  Download the 
Mymesh App, from Apple App 
Store and search for 'Mymesh 
commissioning'. The App will 
ask you to register an account 
and contact Mymesh to com-
mission the installation. For 
other wireless systems please 
contact our Technical 
Department.

Casambi. Download the 
Casambi App, from Apple App 
Store or Google Play following 
the App instructions. This will 
allow commissioning and link-
ing of luminaires, wall panels 
and PIRs etc.

230V AC Supply to 
each fitting connected


